
 

Cricket Coach - person specification 

 Criteria 
 

Essential Desirable 

Qualifications/Professional 
Development 
 

Coaching qualification in cricket 
 

Yes  

Track record of success in coaching 
players and teams 
 

Yes  

Knowledge/Experience 
 

Knowledge of safeguarding 
 

Yes  

Experience of effectively managing 
pupil conduct and behaviour  
 

Yes  

Experience of coaching cricket to a 
high standard 
 

Yes  

Experience working with young 
people in an educational setting 
 

 Yes 

Experience of playing cricket to a 
high standard 
 

 Yes 

An understanding of, and 
commitment to, the School's Equal 
Opportunities policies and a 
willingness to promote equality of 
opportunity an all aspects of the 
work 
 

Yes  

Skills and abilities 
 

Excellent communication skills, 
particularly with pupils, to motivate 
and support them with their studies 
 

Yes  

Enthusiasm and commitment to 
high-quality inspiring coaching 
 

Yes  

Highly flexible to suit the needs of 
the role 
 

Yes  

The ability to work collaboratively 
with colleagues in a professional 
environment 
 

Yes  

Ability to coach cricket to a high 
standard 
 

Yes  

Excellent verbal, written and 
numeracy skills 
 

Yes  



 Ability to prioritise tasks and possess 
a “can do” attitude 
 

Yes  

 Demonstrate an enthusiasm for their 
sport 
 

Yes  

 


